

**Date:** March 7, 2023

**Resolution No:** 2023-248

**Title:** Award of 2023 Engineering Materials Price Agreements ~ Aggregate Materials

**Department/Agency:** Lucas County Engineer

**Contact:** Mike Pniewski, County Engineer

**Summary/Background:** The following vendors submitted pricing to establish unit price agreements for purchase of Aggregate Engineering Materials during calendar year 2023, which has been approved on Resolution #22-1054:

Heidelberg Materials  
4100 Centennial Road  
Sylvania, Ohio 43560  
Est. Amount: \$50,000

**Budget Impact:** 2040.210002; 2040.210010; 2041.210004

**Statutory Authority/ORC:** 307.86

**Commissioner Sobecki offered the following resolution:**

WHEREAS, in consideration of the above, NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of County Commissioners, Lucas County, Ohio, that:

Section 1. This Board hereby approves the award of the 2023 Engineering Materials Price Agreements to various vendors in the estimated amounts, with the total not to exceed amount of \$50,000.

Section 2. This Board directs the Deputy Director of Purchasing to issue Purchase Orders to the vendors listed above in the estimated amounts specified.

Section 3. This Board finds and determines that all formal actions of this Board concerning and relating to the adoption of this resolution were taken in an open meeting of this Board and that all deliberations of this Board that resulted in those formal actions were in a meeting open to the public in compliance with the law.

Section 4. This resolution shall be in full force and effect from and immediately upon its adoption.

**Action Taken:**

Commissioner Gerken voted yes  
Commissioner Skeldon Wozniak voted yes  
Commissioner Sobecki voted yes

**March 7, 2023**

**Award of 2023 Engineering Materials Price Agreements ~ Aggregate Materials**

**Page 2**

A handwritten signature in blue ink that reads "Jody L. Balogh". The signature is written in a cursive style with a large initial "J".

---

Jody L. Balogh, Clerk of the Board

**BID TAB****PROJECT: 2023 ENGINEERING MATERIALS (AGGREGATE MATERIALS)**

BID OPEN: FEBRUARY 27, 2023

<b>HEIDELBERG MATERIALS 4100 CENTENNIAL ROAD SYLVANIA, OHIO 43560</b>
---

REF. NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	Location
<b>AGGREGATE MATERIALS</b>						
1	703.01 Stone Size #1 - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$15.10	\$15.10	<b>Sylvania</b>
2	2nd Plant Location - 703.01 Stone Size #1 - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$15.10	\$15.10	<b>Waterville</b>
3	3rd Plant Location - 703.01 Stone Size #1 - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
4	703.01 Stone Size #2 - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$15.10	\$15.10	<b>Sylvania</b>
5	2nd Plant Location - 703.01 Stone Size #2 - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$15.10	\$15.10	<b>Waterville</b>
6	3rd Plant Location - 703.01 Stone Size #2 - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
7	703.01 Stone Size #67 - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
8	2nd Plant Location - 703.01 Stone Size #67 - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
9	3rd Plant Location - 703.01 Stone Size #67 - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
10	#304 - Aggregate Base (703.17) - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$12.40	\$12.40	<b>Sylvania</b>
11	2nd Plant Location - #304 - Aggregate Base (703.17) - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$12.40	\$12.40	<b>Waterville</b>
12	3rd Plant Location - #304 - Aggregate Base (703.17) - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
13	Aggregate Base 703.16 C, Type D - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$13.15	\$13.15	<b>Sylvania</b>
14	Aggregate Base 703.16 C, Type D - 2nd Plant Location - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$13.15	\$13.15	<b>Waterville</b>
15	Aggregate Base 703.16 C, Type D - 3rd Plant Location - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		

**BID TAB****PROJECT: 2023 ENGINEERING MATERIALS (AGGREGATE MATERIALS)**

BID OPEN: FEBRUARY 27, 2023

<b>HEIDELBERG MATERIALS 4100 CENTENNIAL ROAD SYLVANIA, OHIO 43560</b>						
<b>REF. NO.</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>ESTIMATED QUANTITY</b>	<b>UNIT</b>	<b>UNIT PRICE</b>	<b>TOTAL PRICE</b>	<b>Location</b>
16	703.01 Course Aggregate Stone Size #57 - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$16.25	\$16.25	<b>Sylvania</b>
17	2nd Plant Location - 703.01 Course Aggregate Stone Size #57 - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$16.25	\$16.25	<b>Waterville</b>
18	3rd Plant Location - 703.01 Course Aggregate Stone Size #57 - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
19	#411 Stabilized Crushed Aggregate (703.18) - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$12.65	\$12.65	<b>Sylvania</b>
20	2nd Plant Location - #411 Stabilized Crushed Aggregate (703.18) - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$12.65	\$12.65	<b>Waterville</b>
21	3rd Plant Location - #411 Stabilized Crushed Aggregate (703.18) - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
22	703.05, Washed #8 Stone - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$17.00	\$17.00	<b>Sylvania</b>
23	2nd Plant Location - 703.05, Washed #8 Stone - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$17.00	\$17.00	<b>Waterville</b>
24	3rd Plant Location - 703.05, Washed #8 Stone - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
25	703.05, Washed #9 Stone - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$13.15	\$13.15	<b>Sylvania</b>
26	2nd Plant Location - 703.05, Washed #9 Stone - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$13.15	\$13.15	<b>Waterville</b>
27	3rd Plant Location - 703.05, Washed #9 Stone - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
28	703.03 Natural Sand - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
29	2nd Plant Location - 703.03 Natural Sand - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
30	3rd Plant Location - 703.03 Natural Sand - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
31	703.03 Manufactured Sand - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$11.25	\$11.25	<b>Sylvania</b>

**BID TAB**

**PROJECT: 2023 ENGINEERING MATERIALS (AGGREGATE MATERIALS)**

BID OPEN: FEBRUARY 27, 2023

**HEIDELBERG MATERIALS  
4100 CENTENNIAL ROAD  
SYLVANIA, OHIO 43560**

<b>REF. NO.</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>ESTIMATED QUANTITY</b>	<b>UNIT</b>	<b>UNIT PRICE</b>	<b>TOTAL PRICE</b>	<b>Location</b>
32	2nd Plant Location - 703.03 Manufactured Sand - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$11.25	\$11.25	<b>Waterville</b>
33	3rd Plant Location - 703.03 Manufactured Sand - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		
34	601, Dumped Rock Fill, Type D - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$23.60	\$23.60	<b>Sylvania</b>
35	2nd Plant Location - 601, Dumped Rock Fill, Type D - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	\$23.60	\$23.60	<b>Waterville</b>
36	3rd Plant Location - 601, Dumped Rock Fill, Type D - List Plant Location in Comments Section	1	TONS	<b>No Bid</b>		